
by Jim Stickford

GM will do the right thing.
That was the main message

given by company executives at
the press conference that fol-
lowed CEO Mary Barra’s town-
hall meeting held at GM’s Warren
Tech Center last week.

Barra was flanked by Executive
Vice President, Global Product
Development, Purchasing and
Supply Chain Mark Reuss and
GM President Dan Ammann.

The trio was asked who was el-
igible for monies from the com-
pensation fund that Barra just an-
nounced at the townhall meeting.
The question was followed with,
“Was the fund just for people
who suffered some loss as a re-
sult of an accident tied to the ig-
nition problem, or were people
who suffered degradation of the
value of their vehicles eligible?”

Ammann said the fund will be
administered by attorney Ken-
neth Feinberg.

“The specific rules of the fund
and how it will operate are cur-
rently under review by Kenneth
Feinberg,” Ammann said. “What’s
important is that GM does the
right thing by its customers and
take responsibility for what hap-
pened.”

Barra was asked what the envi-
ronment was at GM during the
time the ignition troubles were

happening. A specific question:
“Was there fear that a recall
would cost too much or was
there just arrogance on the part
of GM officials?”

Barra said that during this time
period, roughly 2005 through
2011, GM had issued a number of
other recalls.

“But the root of the problem,”
Barra said, “was that the part
didn’t meet standards and when
that was discovered the problem
was seen as one of customer sat-
isfaction and not safety. Our engi-
neers didn’t know what would
happen when the key came out
of the ignition.”

When asked how confident she
was that the systemic problems
that led to the ignition switch re-

In the heart of Chrysler’s
Auburn Hills campus, employees
packaged 70,000 meals for Stop
Hunger Now, an international
hunger relief agency.

Using an assembly line-style
process, 260 employees com-
bined more than 7,000 pounds of
rice, 2,900 pounds of soy, and 350
pounds of vegetables with a sea-
soning mix – which includes 21
essential vitamins and minerals –

into small meal packages that
will be shipped to Brazil to sup-
port school feeding programs
and crisis relief.

The timing of this volunteer
event coincides with the launch
of “Motor Citizens,” the new
name for the automaker’s well-es-
tablished volunteer program.

The program gives Chrysler’s
more than 18,000 salaried em-
ployees – in the United States,

Canada and Mexico – 18 hours
paid time off each year to volun-
teer for nonprofit organizations
of their choosing, as well as com-
pany-sponsored initiatives.

“As a company, we are commit-
ted to making service to others
part of our daily mission,” said
Jody Trapasso, Chrysler’s senior
vice president of External Affairs.

“Over the years, we’ve invest-
ed more than half-a-billion dol-

lars in charitable organizations
to help build strong communi-
ties, while our volunteer activi-
ties have impacted millions of
lives.

“Wherever possible, we will
put volunteer hours behind our
grants to better drive social
change.

“Today’s event to help allevi-
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‘We Want to Put Customers First’– GM CEO Barra

GM President Ammann, left, CEO Barra and VP Reuss face the press in Tech Center news conference June 5.

Chrysler Extends Employee Volunteer Work Program

by Jim Stickford

It’s never too soon to think
about a career in the automotive
industry. That’s what Harry Istok
believes.

The retired drafting teacher
just hosted the ninth annual
Utica Community Schools Career
and Technical Education Show-
case last week at the Utica Cen-
ter for Science and Industry in
Sterling Heights.

Istok said that the event got its
start eight years ago when, as a
junior high school teacher at
Malow in the Utica school sys-
tem, he got together with GM de-
sign manager Greg Cummings
and had a car show for students
to show them what they would
be creating if they entered into a
career within the auto industry.

“I come from a designing back-
ground,” Istok said. “I myself
went to Macomb Community
College, and have three degrees
from Wayne State.

“The first show, which had
four cars and four GM employees
was strictly targeted at my draft-
ing students. It evolved into
something else.”

As time went on, Istok said,
more cars were added and Ford
and then Chrysler started partic-
ipating. By 2012, the event had
outgrown Malow and Utica
school officials moved it to its
current location in Sterling
Heights.

“They wanted other students
from other schools in the district
to attend the event,” Istok said.
“It’s no longer the ‘Malow Junior
High School Car Show.’ It’s now
the ‘Utica Community Schools
Career and Technical Education

Auto Showcase,’ where innova-
tion meets design.”

The show gives students the
opportunity to meet with people
who can talk about the industry,
especially design and STEM ele-
ments.

Cummings said he approached
Istok about having some sort of
show because, after attending a
Utica school system open house,
he learned that they wanted to
cut funding for the art and voca-
tional kids.

“We wanted to spark a connec-
tion with the kids so I brought a
few cars to the first show,” Cum-
mings said. “We talked about ca-
reers available and what they
had to do and here we are, eight
years later.

“It’s definitely grown and now
we have many cars from all the
Detroit OEMs. It’s all good and
we all work together to stay con-
nected with the kids. We have a
Facebook page where students
can view videos and post ques-
tions.”

Mike Istok is a Ford body inte-
rior design release engineer and
the son of Harry Istok.

“I can testify firsthand how en-
couragement from an adult, in
this case my dad, can inspire a
student to study engineering and
design,” Mike said.

“Ford is at this event because
about two years after the first
show my dad put on, I got a job
at Ford. My dad asked me for
help in getting Ford to be in-
volved and after I talked about
this with management, they told
me they were delighted to offer
Ford’s support.”

Big 3 Auto Veterans School
Students in Potential Careers

Greg Cummings of GM with cutout of 2015 Stingray

Joe Dehner of Chrysler with 2015 Challenger

Ford Motor Company and
Samsung SDI, an affiliate of Sam-
sung Group, are joining forces to
research on different levels of
hybrid technology that could
one day be produced in high vol-
ume on non-hybrid vehicles for
greater fuel savings.

The result of a 10-year re-
search effort, the dual-battery
system combines a lithium-ion
battery with a 12-volt lead-acid
battery that could enable regen-
erative braking technology in
non-hybrid vehicles for greater
fuel savings, said Ford
spokesperson Susannah Wesley.

“We are currently expanding
our Auto Start-Stop technology
across 70 percent of our lineup,
and this dual-battery system has
the potential to bring even more
levels of hybridization to our ve-
hicles for greater energy savings
across the board,” said Ted
Miller, Ford’s senior manager, En-
ergy Storage Strategy and Re-
search.

“Although still in research,
this type of battery could pro-
vide a near-term solution for
greater reduction of carbon diox-
ide.”

Currently available on Ford’s
hybrid vehicles, regenerative
braking enables the battery to
capture up to 95 percent of the
electrical energy normally lost
during the braking process for
reuse, Miller said.

The system works in conjunc-
tion with Ford’s Auto Start-Stop,
which seamlessly turns off the
engine when a vehicle stops to
save fuel. An advanced battery
then powers vehicle accessories

Ford Research on
Batteries Could

Bring Fuel Savings
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call were fixed, Barra said that
what happened wasn’t accept-
able and was the result of a “trag-
ic set of events.”

She added that she wouldn’t
speculate on what happened
back in 2005 and 2006, but what
happened shouldn’t have. “You
don’t change a part without
changing the part number and
that didn’t happen,” Barra said.

The mind-set at the time the
critical decisions were being
made was brought up, and Barra
said she wished she knew the an-
swer to that. “I believe in my
heart that if we knew what was
going on, we would have acted.
The people that made those deci-
sions are no longer here.”

When asked about the trade-
off between cost and safety,
Barra said there was none. “The
Valukas report said the situation
was misdiagnosed as a customer
satisfaction issue, not a safety is-
sue,” Barra said. “The report also
said there was no conspiracy.”

When pressed, Barra declined
to comment on the 15 individuals
let go from GM as a result of its
internal investigation. She said
that she wouldn’t comment ex-
cept to say that the two people
put on paid leave during the in-
vestigation are no longer with
the company.

She also said that the group of
15 consisted of people from
across several departments, in-
cluding engineering and legal.
She said that about 50 or 60 per-
cent of them were executives or
higher.

Reuss pointed out that one of
the changes that GM has made is
to integrate the legal department
with the new Product Integrity
department.

In responding to a question
about the number of deaths –
based on front-end collisions alone

and not side-impact accidents –
Ammann said GM is not in a posi-
tion to speculate and that it’s the
company’s job to find out who has
suffered and to make sure that
they are compensated.

“We have analyzed all the data
using a specific definition,” Am-
mann said. “That’s how we got
13. What’s important is that we
go out and do the right thing.
The rules of compensation will
be defined by Kenneth Feinberg
and he will administrate them.”

When asked if she was satis-
fied that there wasn’t another re-
call problem out there, Barra
said, “We’ll deal with things as
they come. But, at this time, I
don’t believe so. I think if you
look at some of our recent re-
calls, you’ll see that they are for
really small populations.”

Asked about recall decisions,
Reuss said all three people at the
table – Reuss, Ammann and
Barra – will be involved in decid-
ing about recalls.

“We all want technical people
who are experts to be making de-
cisions, but there will be trans-
parency across the board,” Barra
said.

Reuss said that there was a dis-
connect between different sec-
tions. People tended to look at
one part and not at the vehicle as
a whole, so no one was looking at
how the ignition switch affected
other parts of the Cobalt.

Barra said that GM has pro-
duced about 280,000 repair kits
and that more than 100,000 vehi-
cles have already been fixed.

“Our dealers have been doing
a great job with our customers,

working to make it easy for them
to get their cars fixed,” Barra
said.

Barra also said she didn’t
know if GM would support any
former employees who might
face charges from the Justice De-
partment.

“Culture doesn’t change
overnight,” Barra said. “We have
more to do. This is a journey. We
want to be the car company that
puts our customers first.

“Cars are only going to get
more complex,” Reuss said. “But
the systems we’ve already put in-
to place should prevent this kind
of thing from ever happening
again.”

“People at GM want to build
great cars,” Barra said. They
want to do the right thing for the
customer.”

by Jim Stickford

The news wasn’t good.
That’s why GM CEO Mary Bar-

ra held a company-wide global
town hall meeting centered at
the VEC building in GM’s Warren
Tech Center June 5.

Her remarks were broadcast to
GM facilities around the world.

She said the town hall meeting
was called to share recent find-
ings with employees.

She added that on Monday,
June 2, Anton Valukas, the former
U.S. Attorney hired by the com-
pany to investigate GM’s recall of
Cobalt ignition switches, present-
ed his findings to GM’s board of
directors.

“Mr. Valukas has confirmed
that he and his investigators
were provided with unlimited ac-
cess to interview any GM em-
ployee and every request for an
interview of a GM employee was
granted,” Barra said.

She added that the report was
given to GM’s federal regulator,
the National Highway Traffic
Safety Administration (NHTSA)
and should be available on its
web site to anyone interested in
reading it.

“I can tell you the report is ex-
tremely thorough, brutally tough
and deeply troubling,” Barra
said.

“For those of us who have ded-
icated our lives to this company,
it is enormously painful to have
our shortcomings laid out so
vividly. I was deeply saddened
and disturbed as I read the re-
port.

“But this isn’t about our feel-
ings or our egos. This is about
our responsibility to act with in-
tegrity, honor and a commitment
to excellence.”

She said the recall issue wasn’t
just an engineering, manufactur-
ing or legal problem. It repre-
sents a fundamental failure of GM
to meet the basic needs of its
customers.

Valukas’ investigation revealed
that on multiple occasions “indi-
viduals failed to disclose critical
pieces of information that could
have fundamentally changed the
lives of those impacted by a
faulty ignition switch.”

Barra went on to say that nu-
merous people did not accept
any responsibility to drive GM to
understand what was happening.

“The report highlights a com-
pany that operated in silos, with
a number of individuals seeming-
ly looking for reasons not to act,
instead of finding ways to protect
our customers.”

That is unacceptable, Barra
said, and never should have hap-
pened.

The report had several conclu-
sions.

First, GM personnel’s inability
to address the ignition switch
problem persisted for about 11
years. This represents a history
of failures.

And while many people had a
responsibility to fix the problem,
no one took that responsibility.

“Throughout the entire 11-year
history, there was no demon-
strated sense of urgency, right to
the very end,” Barra said.

“The ignition switch issue was
touched by numerous parties at
GM – engineers, investigators,
lawyers – but nobody raised the
problem to the highest levels of
the company.

“Overall, the report concludes
that from start to finish, the
Cobalt saga was riddled with fail-
ures, which led to tragic results
for many.”

Valukas’ report showed no
conspiracy trading safety for
cost. Rather, Barra said, the case
was more complicated and nu-
anced.

“What Valukas found was a pat-
tern of management deficiencies
and misjudgments often based
on incomplete data that were
passed off at the time as busi-
ness as usual,” Barra said.

As the facts have become
known over the past few months,
Barra said that GM has acted ag-
gressively to correct the prob-
lems and restructure the internal
systems that allowed them to de-
velop.

“We have named Jeff Boyer
vice president of Safety for the
company,” Barra said, “elevating
and integrating our safety
processes under a single leader.

Jeff reports directly to Mark
Reuss, and Jeff and I meet regu-
larly.”

GM has also hired 35 more
safety inspectors and instituted a
“Speak Up for Safety” program to
encourage employees to report
potential safety issues quickly.

“And we are going to recognize
them for doing so,” Barra said.

GM has also implemented a
new Global Product Integrity or-
ganization, Barra said. The final
act was to restructure the safety
decision-making process to raise
it to the highest levels of the
company.

“Senior management is now
going to be at the center of these
issues,” Barra said.

Company officials also made
personnel decisions. Fifteen indi-
viduals who were determined to
have acted inappropriately “are
no longer with the company,”
Barra said.

“Some were removed because
of what we consider misconduct
or incompetence. Others have
been relieved because they sim-
ply didn’t do enough. They didn’t
take responsibility, didn’t act
with any sense of urgency.”

Barra also announced that GM
has established a compensation
program that will be run by attor-
ney Kenneth Feinberg. He will be
responsible for reviewing op-
tions and administering the pro-
gram.

“We have to personalize this
challenge,” Barra said. “Quality
and safety aren’t someone else’s
responsibilities. They are mine,
they are yours. We all must feel a
personal responsibility to see
that this company excels at
every level.”

Barra concluded the town hall
by telling employees that she be-
lieves in them and she believes
in GM.

She said, “I want GM to be the
world’s best automotive compa-
ny – for customers. Whatever it
takes to do that is what we are
going to do.”
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3RD ANNUAL CULVER’S
CRUISER POKER RUN

(OVER 22O LAST YEAR)

SAT JUNE 14TH 1PM-6PM

LLiivvee EEnntteerrttaaiinnmmeenntt && PPrriizzeess aatt CCuullvveerrss AAllll DDaayy
Register at Culvers Lake Orion (M-24 & Dutton Rd) - South

Register Stop or Roadside Attractions
(3549 S. Lapeer Rd., Metamora, MI) - North Registration Stop

Stop by 16 Businesses and receive a Sealed Poker Card and return it to 
Culvers before 5:00pm. 6pm Sharp the Winners will be Announced.

VISIT OUR WEBSITE FOR MORE INFORMATION

WWW.CULVERSLAKEORION.COM

OR CALL JOE ZIMMER AT CULVERS

248-276-2222
You can enter The Poker Run with any Car or Motorcycle

(Rain Date Saturday 6/21/2014)

1st Place $500
2nd Place $250
3rd Place $150
4th Place $100
5th Place $50

1ST
PLACE

$500
CASH

OVER$1,000
IN CASH
PRIZES

ROLLBACK PRICES ARE BACK 11 a.m. - 4 p.m.

FINE DINING SINCE 1933; NORTHERN ITALIAN CUISINE

®

Lelli’s Restaurant
855 N. Opdyke 248-373-4440

In Auburn Hills
� BUSINESS LUNCHEONS � DINNER 4 pm-10 pm

Be in and out in 45 minutes.
The Lelli family wants everyone

to come and experience
fine dining…

Housemade Pasta dishes
starting at $9.95

Barra Calls Investigator’s Report ‘Extremely
Thorough, Brutally Tough, Deeply Troubling’

Barra speaks to employees at Tech Center and globally via broadcast.

‘We Want to Put Customers First’ – GM CEO Mary Barra

Shelby Township-based FEC
Automation is opening its first
European office in Chelmsford,
England.

“The auto industry is thriving
now, even in Europe, and the de-
mands on suppliers like us con-
tinue to multiply,” said company
owner Ron Jaeger. “We see oppor-
tunities to grow our business by
going after it more aggressively
and being more accessible local-
ly. We already have customers in
England, Romania and Germany
and we’re talking about meaning-
ful opportunities in Russia.

“Chelmsford is a small office
but it will give us a European
base and allow us to be quicker
and more responsive to existing
and potential customers.”

Jaeger said a high number of
new vehicle product launches are
coming and the fact that many
suppliers had to downsize during
the recession has opened up op-
portunities for FEC, which manu-
factures and installs fastening
and assembly equipment for
OEMs around the world.

Local Company
To Open First
European Office

http://www.detroitautoscene.com
mailto:info@detroitautoscene.com


ate hunger demonstrates the en-
thusiasm and commitment that
Chrysler employees bring to
serving our communities.”

Chrysler employees located in
Canada and Mexico also organ-
ized hunger relief volunteer
events the same day to benefit
local organizations, Trapasso
said.

In Canada, employees wanted
to raise awareness for the need
to support local food banks on a
year-round basis, not just during
the holidays, so volunteers spent
the day helping with the food
program at the Downtown Mis-
sion of Windsor.

They brought with them a
Dodge Grand Caravan full of em-
ployee-donated food items, as
well as a $7,500 donation, which
will be shared among the Down-
town Mission of Windsor, The
Salvation Army and the Society
of Saint Vincent de Paul for their
food bank programs.

Meanwhile, in Mexico City, 60
volunteers from Chrysler de
Mexico helped package and de-
liver more than seven tons of
food (approximately 10,500
meals) in conjunction with the
Solo por Ayudar Foundation, Tra-
passo said. The food will be dis-
tributed to a community located
near the company’s Toluca Com-
plex.

Chrysler spokesman Kevin
Frazier said Chrysler’s Motor
Citizens volunteer program
complements the decades-long
legacy of the Chrysler Founda-
tion, which serves as the pri-
mary conduit for Chrysler
Group to give back to the com-
munity.

In its more than 60 years of its
existence, he said, the Chrysler
Foundation has granted more
than half-a-billion dollars to
worthwhile organizations and
causes.

To further support Chrysler
Group’s commitment to volun-
teerism, the Chrysler Foun-
dation has established a Motor
Citizens grant program to sup-
plement employees’ volunteer
service.

Under the program, the
Chrysler Foundation will provide
eligible U.S. nonprofits a $500
Motor Citizens grant when a
team of 10 or more employees
contribute a total of 30 hours of
service to a project.

“We have created new tools, in-
cluding the Motor Citizens volun-
teer website, to better meet the
needs of our employee volun-
teers and our nonprofit partners
who are driving social change,”
said Trapasso.

“The Chrysler Motor Citizens
volunteer program goes beyond
the walls of our offices to help
build strong communities both
here at home and around the
world.”

Accordingly, Chrysler Group is

also launching an online toolkit
for its dealers to plan, manage
and track their volunteer activi-
ties within their communities,
Frazier said.

Dealers have a tradition of
community involvement, he said,
that ranges from supporting
local athletic programs and
scouting to providing support
following natural disasters.

In addition to these recent vol-
unteer efforts, the automaker in-
troduced an internal marketing

campaign to encourage salaried
employees to “Be an Engine for
Change” by using their volunteer
hours to help others.

Spirited slogans such as “Tell
your boss you need to work for
someone else;” “Your time and
talents are needed elsewhere;”
and “Helping others starts by
helping yourself to 18 hours of
paid time off,” call on the army of
Chrysler Group volunteers to go
out and make a difference in the
world, Frazier said.
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Chrysler’s Rob Ciborowski helps pack meals to provide for school feeding programs and crisis relief in Brazil.

Chrysler Staffers
Get Packing with
Food Donations

Chrysler Canada’s month of
May recorded its 54th consecu-
tive month of year-over-year
sales growth, representing the
longest sales streak in the com-
pany’s history.

May 2014 sales were 31,498,
compared with 29,249 in May
2013, representing an 8 per cent
increase. Chrysler Canada re-
mains the top-selling automotive
company in the country in 2014.

“Robust May sales kicked off
the execution phase of our sec-
ond five-year plan with a re-
sounding success,” said David
Buckingham, COO of Chrysler
Canada. “In fact, May sales were
the strongest of any month in
our company’s 89-year history.”

The Jeep brand in Canada ex-
perienced its best sales month of
all-time with 7,531 vehicles sold
in May. Thus far in 2014, Jeep
Wrangler is the best-selling com-
pact SUV in Canada and Jeep
Cherokee experienced its best
sales month since arriving in
Canada last November with
2,208 vehicles sold.

In Canada, May 2014 sales for
both the overall Ram brand and
the Ram pickup truck broke new
ground by setting an all-time
sales record with 9,803 units
sold by the brand, of which 9,074
were Ram pickup trucks. The
Windsor, Ontario-built Dodge
Grand Caravan continues to be
the best-selling minivan in the
country.

Chrysler Sales in
Canada Reach
Record Levels



Ford Motor Company has un-
veiled its Lightweight Concept
vehicle, which uses advanced
materials to explore future
weight-reduction solutions that
could improve performance and
fuel efficiency while reducing
carbon dioxide emissions.

The vehicle, which made its
debut last week, represents the
latest phase of Ford’s research
into developing sustainable tech-
nology solutions that are afford-
able for consumers and can be
produced in large volumes
across the product lineup, said
Ford spokesman Jake Dylik.

This research has also led to dra-
matic weight reductions of up to
700 pounds in the all-new F-150.
The 2015 F-150 sheds weight
through the use of high-strength
steel and aluminum, enabling it to
tow more, haul more, accelerate
quicker and stop shorter – all with
improved gas mileage, said Dylik.

“Consumers today want better
fuel efficiency, but they also want
more technology and features in
the car, which usually adds
weight to the vehicle,” said Raj
Nair, Ford group vice president,
Global Product Development.

“A focus on light-weighting will
be fundamental to our industry for
years to come, and we are inves-
tigating many advanced materials
applications as possible solutions
for weight reduction in our vehi-
cles.”

Light-weighting is a key com-
ponent in Ford’s Blueprint for

Sustainability, Nair said, which
integrates sustainability into the
business plan for the long-term
preservation and enhancement
of environmental, social and fi-
nancial capital.

The introduction and incorpo-
ration of lightweight materials in-
to vehicle construction helps
meet the goal of reducing weight
to achieve better fuel economy
for consumers while also reduc-
ing greenhouse gas emissions.

Ford’s research into improved
efficiency through weight reduc-
tion with advanced materials in-
cluding new metals, alloys and
composites began more than 25
years ago.

This research produced the
breakthrough Aluminum Inten-
sive Vehicle program in 1992 and
all-aluminum high-performance
Ford GT in 2005, Nair said.

Along with other fuel-efficiency
technologies, light-weighting is
fundamental to Ford’s efforts to
stabilize carbon dioxide concen-
trations in the atmosphere at 450
parts per million – the level many
scientists, businesses and gov-
ernmental agencies believe may
avoid the most serious effects of
climate change, Nair said.

As consumer electronics like
cellphones and tablets become
more lightweight, so does the ul-
timate mobile device – the vehi-
cle.

Ford’s Lightweight Concept us-
es many of the same advanced
materials found in today’s light-

weight electronic devices, includ-
ing aluminum, chemically tough-
ened glass and advanced light-
weight plastics, said Nair.

“Ford engineers took a holistic
approach to weight reduction by
incorporating advanced materi-
als into the entire design of the ve-
hicle, including powertrain, chas-
sis, body, battery and interior fea-
tures such as seats,” Nair said.

“This Lightweight Concept ve-
hicle represents its most compre-
hensive blend of advanced mate-
rials yet in one vehicle, including
strategic application of aluminum,
ultra-high-strength steels, magne-
sium and carbon fiber.”

The research vehicle was de-
veloped with the U.S. Depart-
ment of Energy’s Vehicle Tech-
nologies Program, together with
Cosma International – a sub-
sidiary of Magna International –
to illustrate long-term potential
light-weighting solutions.

Magna’s design and develop-
ment of the multi-material body-
in-white, closures and chassis
components are a significant
contribution in light-weighting

the concept vehicle, Dylik said.
“Our goal was to investigate

how to design and build a mixed-
materials, lightweight vehicle
that could potentially be pro-
duced in high volume, while pro-
viding the same level of safety,
durability and toughness as our
vehicles on the road today,” said
Matt Zaluzec, Ford technical
leader, Global Materials and Man-
ufacturing Research.

“There’s not a one-size-fits-all
approach to light-weighting.

“The Lightweight Concept
gives us the platform to continue
to explore the right mix of mate-
rials and applications for future
vehicles.”

Other industries have incorpo-
rated lighter-weight advanced
materials to achieve greater fuel
economy, speed and perform-
ance, Zaluzec said.
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Subway/Oakland Mall
498 14 Mile Rd
248-307-1271
1939 W. Maple Rd
West of Crooks
248-435-2846

Subway/Walmart
2001 W. Maple Rd
West of Crooks
248-435-2431

TROY

31690 Mound Rd
13 & Mound
586-939-1000
26627 Hoover Rd
11 & Hoover
586-754-8205
30820 Hoover Rd
13 & Hoover
586-573-7829
29144 Ryan Rd
12 & Ryan
586-573-8000

28950 Van Dyke Ave
12 & Van Dyke
586-558-3882

Drive Thru Service:
NOW OPEN 24 HOURS
32620 Van Dyke Ave
South of 14 Mile
586-795-0000
Subway/Meijer
29505 Mound Road
12 Mile & Mound
586-558-0100 

Subway - Walmart
29176 Van Dyke
Warren, MI 48093
586-393-1008

66603 Van Dyke
South of 31 Mile
586-752-6500

ROMEO

NOW OPEN•DRIVE THRU
13160 32 Mile Road
32 & Van Dyke X-Way
586-281-6359 

WASHINGTON TWP.
STERLING HGTS.

8178 23 Mile Rd
23 & Van Dyke
586-739-4100

Subway/Walmart
NOW OPEN 24 HOURS
51450 Shelby Pkwy
23 & Van Dyke X-Way
586-254-8140

SHELBY

Subway/Walmart
28804 Gratiot
12 & Gratiot
586-773-1682

ROSEVILLE

Inside 
Chrysler
STAMPING

Inside 
Chrysler
SHAP

37876 Van Dyke
at 16 1/2 Mile
586-795-8368
Subway/Walmart
NOW OPEN 24 HOURS
33201 Van Dyke
14 & Van Dyke
586-274-4319
Subway/Meijer
36600 Van Dyke Ave
586-795-1606
38357 Dodge Park
at Plumbrook
586-264-5300

40058 Van Dyke
18 Mile & Van Dyke
586-939-4500

SubwayChrysler
35777 Van Dyke
586-795-0205

NOW OPEN 24 HOURS
7960 Metro Parkway
Van Dyke & Metro Pkwy
586-268-0800
SubwayChrysler
38111 Van Dyke
586-268-6900

WARREN URGENTCARE

“We Care”
URGENT CARE FOR ACCIDENTS AND INJURY

ADULT & PEDIATRIC ILLNESS
Digital X-Rays, EKG and Lab Work, On-Site Lab Service, Strep, Mono,
Pregnancy & Urine Testing, Vaccinations, Sports & School Physicals,

Occupational Medicine, Work-Related Injuries,
Pre-Hire Physicals (BAT & Urine Screening)

SPECIAL ON SPORTS PHYSICAL $25.00 State-of-the-Art Facility

8am-10pm • 7 Days a week • 365 Days a Year
“Bringing Quality Urgent Care To Your Neighborhood”

586-276-8200
31700 Van Dyke • Warren, MI 48093

On Van Dyke Rd., between 13 & 14 Mile in
St. John’s Windemere Park

OTHER CONVENIENT LOCATIONS:

ATTENTION
Chrysler, GM, Ford

Employees, we’re within
2 miles of your plants

HAP & BCN
NO Referrals Needed!
www.warrenurgentcare.com

FLU SHOTS

Woodland Urgent Care
22341 W. 8 Mile Road

Detroit

313-387-8700

N. East Macomb Urgent Care
43900 Garfield, Suite 121

Clinton Township

586-868-2600

Looking for an event that com-
bines two of America’s great
loves – cars and poker?

Then you might want to check
out the third annual Culver’s M-
24 Poker Run Cruise, which takes
place from 1 to 6 p.m. Saturday,
June 14.

The cruise begins and ends at
Culver’s of Lake Orion at the cor-
ner of M-24 and Dutton, a half-mile
north of the Palace, said event
spokesperson Allan Nahajewski.

Cruisers will visit 16 business-
es on M-24 in Lake Orion, Oxford
and Metamora. At each stop, par-
ticipants will pick up a sealed
playing card. The object is to use
the cards to put together the
best poker hand.

More than $1,000 in cash prizes
will be awarded, with the winner
receiving $500. Last year’s Poker
Run attracted more than 220 cruis-
ers, Nahajewski said.

“It’s great family fun, especially
if you love classic cars,” said
event organizer and sponsor Joe
Zimmer, owner of Culver’s of
Lake Orion. “If you need a fresh
idea for a Father’s Day gift, what
could be better than spending
quality time with your dad on the
Poker Run Cruise?”

The entire cruise takes 60 to 90
minutes. Participants can start the
cruise any time between 1 p.m.
and 3:30 p.m., Zimmerman said.
Cruisers must finish by 5 p.m.

Prize winners will be an-
nounced at Culver’s at 6 p.m. The
event includes live entertain-
ment at Culver’s all day.

“Participants can register in
advance at Culver’s of Lake Ori-
on or Roadside Attractions of
Metamora,” Zimmerman said.

“You can also register on the
day of the event at Culver’s. Reg-
istration is $10, but participants
can get their money back by us-
ing the two $5 coupons that
come with the cruise ticket.

“The coupons are for Culver’s
and for $5 off for an oil change at
Golling Buick GMC. Event pro-
ceeds benefit the Future Farmers
of America.”

Nahajewski said that in addi-
tion to Culver’s and Roadside At-
tractions, other participating M-
24 businesses include Golling
Buick GMC, O’Reilly Auto Parts,
Buffalo Wild Wings, Auto Works
of Oxford, Burdick Street Land-
scape, Crossfit & Nutritional
Planning, Affordable Fuel Injec-
tion, 4-M Collision, Mr. C’s Car
Wash, Orion Sports Bar, Orion
Auto Service Center, Crates Cof-
fee House, Chicago Brothers Piz-
za and Allegro Music Studios.

Zimmerman said Culver’s is a
popular spot for classic car enthu-
siasts, hosting a cruise every
Tuesday evening all summer long.

“By signing up for a free Cul-
ver’s Cruise Card, you can re-
ceive a 15 percent discount at
Culver’s of Lake Orion through-
out the year,” Zimmerman said.

For details about the Poker
Run and the weekly cruises, visit
www.culverslakeorion.com and
click on “Car Cruise Informa-
tion.”

Culver’s ‘Farmers of America’
Event Looking for Full House

Focus on Light-Weighting
Produces Ford Concept Car

Ford’s Lightweight Concept car shows the way to better performance.

DETROIT (AP) – Brisk demand
for SUVs and pickup trucks – and
five sunny weekends – pushed
U.S. auto sales to a nine-year
high in May.

Chrysler, Nissan and Toyota
all reported double-digit sales
gains over last May. Even Gener-
al Motors, battling bad publicity
from a mishandled recall, sur-
prised with a 13 percent sales in-
crease. Ford’s sales rose a bet-
ter-than-expected 3 percent,
while Hyundai’s were up 4 per-
cent. Of major automakers, only
Volkswagen’s sales fell.

May is traditionally a strong
month for the auto industry, as
buyers spend their tax returns
and think ahead to summer road
trips. This year’s calendar, with
five weekends, gave it an extra
boost. Sales were particularly
strong the last weekend of the
month, automakers said.

Sales rose 11 percent to just
over 1.6 million in May. That was
the highest monthly total since
July 2005, according to Kelley
Blue Book. The surge helped
erase doubts about the strength
of the industry. Winter sales
were weaker than expected as
buyers spent more time shovel-
ing snow than shopping.

May Car Sales
Show Strength of
New Car Market
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Mike Istok and Marcy Fisher of Ford with 2015 Mustang

Mike Istok also agrees with
both his father and Cummings
that by showing students what
the possibilities are in the auto
industry, they are helping the
students choose a productive ca-
reer path.

“The value of events like this is
that the kids who are into art and
design get to see that they have a
vibrant career choice available
to them that can offer a lifetime’s
worth of employment.

“When I talk to the kids, I see
their enthusiasm and I get enthu-
siastic for them. They remind me
of myself when I was their age.

“They ask me questions like,
what science courses to they
have to take? Do I like working at
Ford? These were the questions I
was asking myself 20 years ago
when I was 16.”

Mike said another encouraging
sign he’s noticed over the past
couple of years is a “good mix of
male and female students com-
ing by and asking questions.”
When he was younger, the mix of
students was skewed male.

Ford also sent Marcy Fisher, its
vehicle line director, to the show-
case. She herself is a Malow grad-
uate and received her degree in
mechanical engineering and her
MBA from U-M.

“I’m here to talk to the ladies in
the audience,” Fisher said. “I talk
about STEM education and how
when I started in the industry
more than 20 years ago, it was
rare to see a woman mechanical
engineer.”

But, said Fisher, that’s changed
over the years. Not only is the
automotive industry more di-
verse in terms of hiring women,
it’s just plain more diverse peri-
od.

“The industry just isn’t a
bunch of guys named Smith any-
more,” Fisher said. “And this di-
versity is good because it brings
in new perspectives and new
ideas from people who represent
the buying public. That’s why
our cars are great today.”

Fisher said that now, more
than ever, it’s vital for automak-
ers to know the marketplace and
understand who their buyers are
and what they want in an auto-
mobile.

Diversity just isn’t some sort of
nod to political correctness, he
said, it’s the foundation of sound
business practices in the 21st
century.

Joe Dehner, head of Dodge and
Ram Exterior Design, said this
was the third year he’s been at
the showcase.

“This is important because we
need to continue to create a
pipeline of students to get into
the auto industry and this is a
great venue in which we can in-
fluence young, impressionable
minds,” Dehner said.

“By showing them the cars, by
showing them how we can create
digital sculptures, by showing all
the work that goes into making a
car in an interactive way, as well
as showing them fields that they
never knew existed, we can offer
them a future. It’s also exciting,
when talking to students and
showing them what we do, see-
ing the light bulb go off.”

Dehner had to admit it’s also
fun to show off what Chrysler’s
muscle cars can do.

“When we rev up the engines,
you should see the looks on stu-
dents’ faces,” Dehner said.

The ultimate goal, said Mike Is-
tok, is to show students the
process that takes an idea “from
art to parts.”

“Everything that was ever
made started with an idea,” Mike
said. “We want to show students
the sketch of an idea that be-
comes part of an engine or vehi-
cle interior at Ford.

Students Schooled in Potential Auto Careers
CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

and systems in place of the en-
gine until the driver begins to re-
lease the brake pedal, which
restarts the engine.

Ford and Samsung SDI also are
researching a longer-term ultra-
lightweight lithium-ion battery
that could one day render tradi-
tional lead-acid batteries obso-
lete. The research advances lithi-
um-ion battery technology cur-
rently available on Ford’s electri-
fied vehicles, Wesley said.

“Lithium-ion batteries are typi-
cally used in consumer electron-
ics because they are lighter and
more energy-dense than other
types of batteries, which also
make them ideal for the vehicle,”
said Mike O’Sullivan, vice presi-
dent, Automotive Battery Sys-
tems for Samsung SDI North
America.

“Battery technology is advanc-
ing rapidly and lithium-ion could
one day completely replace tra-
ditional 12-volt lead-acid batter-
ies, providing better fuel efficien-
cy for drivers.”

Lithium-ion batteries currently
used in Ford’s electrified vehi-
cles are 25 percent to 30 percent
smaller than previous hybrid
batteries made of nickel-metal-
hydride, and offer approximately
three times the power per cell.

The ultra-lightweight battery
concept offers a weight reduc-
tion of up to 40 percent, or 12
pounds. Combining the battery
with other weight reduction so-
lutions, such as the Ford Light-
weight Concept vehicle, could
lead to additional savings in size
and weight of the overall vehicle,
as well as increased efficiencies
and performance, Miller said.

Last year, the Dearborn auto-
maker invested $135 million in
design, engineering and produc-
tion of key battery components,
and doubled its battery testing
capabilities.

Ford accelerated its battery
durability testing, with test bat-
teries now accumulating the
equivalent of 150,000 miles of
use and 10 years’ life in roughly
10 months in a laboratory set-
ting.

Ford, Wesley said, has directly
supported several energy stor-
age companies in California in
their technology development
through the United States Ad-
vanced Battery Consortium.

Further, he said, Ford sup-
ports energy storage research at
Lawrence Berkeley National Lab-
oratory, University of California,
Berkeley, and Stanford.

Ford Research on
Batteries Could
Bring Fuel Savings
CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1
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FIAT of LakesideFIAT of Lakeside
LIFE IS BEST WHEN DRIVEN
LEASE SPECIALS!

Everyones Price
$13,065*

888-566-4760
www.FIATofLakeside.com • 18181 Hall Rd. • Macomb. MI 48044
*Price includes any and all rebates & discounts assigned to dealer. Payments are plus tax, title and plates, security deposit may be required by lender. $352.00 or more due at signing on the 500L. Financing thru Chrysler Capital. **For quailified Chrysler
Employee. **Price includes any and all rebates & discounts assigned to dealer. Payments are plus tax, title and plates. $307.00 due at signing on the 500L. Financing thru Chrysler Capital. Vehicles shown may not be actual vehicle. Sale ends 6/30/14

The has arrived 4 Door, 5 Passenger.
Family Vehicle

FIAT Sport
Hatch Back

FIAT c
Abarth Cabrio

FIAT POP
Hatch Back

Manual Transmission • Sunroof

Everyones Price
$13,904*

Everyones Price
$21,211*

Stk. #31540
MSRP $19,400Stk. #31028

MSRP $18,450
Stk. #35012
MSRP $29,250

– 2013 CLEARANCE SALE –

Employee Lease
$307**

24 Month/10K

Everyones Lease
$352*

or slightly higher
24 Month/10K

NNEEWW 22001144
DDOODDGGEE DDAARRTT

2244 MMOO.. 11--PPAAYY LLEEAASSEE

$$$$ 3333 ,,,,9999 9999 555500000000
JJUUSSTT AADDDD TTAAXX

2244 MMOONNTTHH LLEEAASSEE

$$$$9999 777755555555****
$$2233,,007722..5555 DDUUEE AATT SSIIGGNNIINNGG

NNEEWW 22001144
DDOODDGGEE CCHHAARRGGEERR
RR//TT

RREEMMOOTTEE SSTTAARRTT,,
HHEEAATTEEDD SSEEAATTSS

88..44”” TTOOUUCCHH SSCCRREEEENN
MMEEDDIIAA CCEENNTTEERR

SSTTKK.. ##44--88110099

NNEEWW 22001144
RRAAMM 11550000
CCRREEWW CCAABB
44XX44

OOUUTTDDOOOORRSSMMAANN SSTTKK.. ##4499770011

2244 MMOO.. 11--PPAAYY LLEEAASSEE

$$3333 ,,,, 9999 7777 22227799**
JJUUSSTT AADDDD TTAAXX

2244 MMOONNTTHH LLEEAASSEE

$$1111111199993333**
$$ 11,,997788..4444 DDUUEE AATT SSIIGGNNIINNGG

OORR LLEESSSS

NNEEWW 22001144
DDOODDGGEE JJOOUURRNNEEYY
RR//TT

SSTTKK.. ##4433229955

NNEEWW 22001144
DDOODDGGEE GGRRAANNDD
CCAARRAAVVAANN
SSEE

RROOAADD TTRRIIPP TTIIMMEE!! SSTTKK.. ##4466118822

NNEEWW 22001144
DDOODDGGEE
DDUURRAANNGGOO

SSTTKK.. ##4477009911

28400 Van Dyke www.vandykedodge.com DODGE/RAM SALES LINE: 1-586-573-4000
*The above purchase prices are plus tax, title, doc, and destination; include Chrysler’s standard rebates plus the lease pull ahead/returning lease rebates. Lease payments are based on Chrysler Capital Tier 1 approval, 10,000 miles per year, and will have a $395 disposition fee at lease
termination. Lease payments are also based on Chrysler’s standard rebates plus lease pull ahead/loyalty rebates. Security deposit is not required. One pay leases just add tax, due at signing includes first payment, taxes and fees, just add plates. Residency restrictions apply. +or less,
if you qualify for an employee, supplier, military, or friends discount your price could be lower. †See dealer for details. Expires 6/9/14.

IN WARRENIN WARREN

EEEEAAAASSSSYYYY TTTTOOOO GGGGEEEETTTT TTTTOOOO…………EEEEAAAASSSSYYYY TTTTOOOO DDDDEEEEAAAALLLL WWWWIIIITTTTHHHH FFFFOOOORRRR OOOOVVVVEEEERRRR 55550000YYYYEEEEAAAARRRRSSSS!!!!!!!!!!!!

2244 MMOO.. 11--PPAAYY LLEEAASSEE

$$3333 ,,,, 9999 9999 7777**
JJUUSS TT AADDDD TTAAXX

2244 MMOONNTTHH LLEEAASSEE

$$11111111 55559922**
$$11,,448822..8877 DD UUEE AATT SSIIGGNNIINNGG

OORR LLEESSSS

PPUURRCCHHAASSEE

$$1111 6666 ,,,, 8888 9999 7777**

2244 MMOONNTTHH LLEEAASSEE

$$1111 5555 99996644**
$$22,,996699 ..22 22 DDUUEE AATT SSIIGGNNIINN GG

OORR LLEESSSS

PPUURRCCHHAASSEE

$$22225555,,,, 888899997777**
2244 MMOONNTTHH LLEEAASSEE

$$1111777788884488**
$$22,,999977..2255 DD UUEE AATT SSIIGGNNIINNGG

EEVVEERRYYOONNEE
QQUUAALLIIFFIIEESS!!

RREEMMOOTTEE SSTTAARRTT,,
HHEEAATTEEDD SSEEAATTSS &&

HHEEAATTEEDD SSTTEEEERRIINNGG WWHHEEEELL
IINNCCLLUUDDEEDD

SSTTKK.. ##4422005500

2244 MMOO.. 11--PPAAYY LLEEAASSEE

$$3333 ,,,, 7777 9999 5555**
JJUUSSTT AADDDD TTAAXX

2244 MMOONNTTHH LLEEAASSEE

$$1111 8888 66669955**
$$888866..3366 DDUUEE AATT SSIIGGNNIINNGG

PPOOWWEERR SSEEAATTSS
77 PPAASSSSEENNGGEERR SSEEAATTIINNGG

&& ZZOONNEE AAUUTTOOMMAATTIICC
TTEEMMPPEERRAATTUURREE CCOONNTTRROOLL

Last year’s first-place photo showed winner Jamie Moore.

What happens when a soda
company and an Italian car
brand decide to celebrate sum-
mer?

Someone ends up with a free
car.

Jones Soda Co., a leader in the
premium soda market, which is
known for its unique flavors and
branding, said Chrysler
spokesperson Diane Morgan, has
again joined with Fiat in a photo
promotion contest where the
ultimate prize is a brand new Fiat
500.

Last year, the two companies
partnered up and created
“Jonesin’ for a Fiat 500.” It was so
successful that the two compa-
nies decided to do it again in
2014, Morgan said.

The Grand Prize winner of the
2014 contest, Morgan said, will
receive a new 2014 Fiat 500, as
well as surf lessons.

The winner will also partici-
pate in a photo shoot with Jones-
sponsored professional surfer
Brianna Cope. The winner also
will get a GO Pro Hero 3 Camera
and equipment.

The winning photo will be fea-
tured on a production run of
Jones Stripped soda in 2015.

“Jonesin’ for a Fiat,” which
runs from June 3 through Nov. 1,
continues to be an integral part
of the overall marketing cam-
paign for Jones Soda and the Fiat
Brand to celebrate both compa-
nies’ ongoing partnership, Mor-
gan said. Contestants who sub-
mit photos or “selfies” will also
have a chance to win weekly
Prize Packs of Jones Soda and
Fiat merchandise, Morgan said.

Participants in the U.S. and
Canada enter the contest by sub-
mitting their qualifying photos
using the hashtag #Jonesin-
foraFiat500 through Jones Soda
Co.’s Official Website, Instagram,
Twitter and Facebook pages.
Submissions will be judged
based on the quality and creativi-
ty of the photos.

In addition to the photo con-
test, Morgan said, the companies

partnered on a variety of other
successful campaigns in Califor-
nia throughout 2013, including a
presence at the Vans U.S. Open of
Surfing, the Fiat dealership pro-
gram and social media initia-
tives.

Jones and the Fiat brand’s first
joint photo contest ran in con-
junction with both brands
launching new products in Cali-
fornia in 2013.

“When Fiat and Jones got to-
gether last year, we realized that
it was the start of a great collabo-
ration and, after the success of
last year’s events, we definitely
want to expand our partnership.
We couldn’t have asked for a bet-
ter, like-minded brand partner,”
said Jennifer Cue, CEO, Jones
Soda.

“Our partnership last summer
with Natural Jones Soda was a
great success,” said Jason Stoice-
vich, head of Fiat Brand North
America.

“By utilizing the social media
space to engage consumers
through photography, we have
been able to showcase a differ-
ent side of our brand as it was
captured by the eyes of the con-
testants. We look forward to see-
ing the fantastic photos to be
posted this year and finding out
who will drive home a brand new
2014 Fiat 500.”

Further details on the contest,
including the official rules, and
other events taking place can be
found at facebook.com/fiatusa or
fiatusa.com.

Take a Unique Photo and
Win a New 2014 Fiat 500

The age-old question, “How do
you get to Carnegie Hall?” is usu-
ally answered with, “Practice.”

The performers at Chrysler’s
“Bravo! Bravo! 2014” show obvi-
ously practiced a great deal. And
that’s how they got to the Detroit
Opera House June 6.

The performance, “Escape the
Everyday – A Cultural Experi-
ence,” was presented by
Chrysler brand.

The event was hosted by Jay
Towers of Fox 2 WJBK and FRESH
100.3, and featured main stage
entertainment by La Dolce Vita,
DJ Stacey “Hottwaxx” Hale fea-
turing Nyumba Muziki LIVE, and
DJ Matt Aubrey and TOnE’, said
Chrysler spokesperson Diane
Morgan.

“The Chrysler brand stands
committed to supporting De-

troit’s rich legacy as a world-
class contributor to music and
the arts through great partner-
ships such as our alliance with
the Detroit Opera House,” said Al
Gardner, president and CEO –
Chrysler Brand.

“‘BravoBravo!’ provided music
lovers with the opportunity to
enjoy an unforgettable evening
and give back to one of the cul-
tural cornerstones that makes
this city so great.”

Now in its 15th year, “Bravo!
Bravo!” celebrated the city and
invited guests to “escape the
everyday at a sophisticated
evening celebrating cultures of
the world with food, drinks, mu-
sic and dancing,” Morgan said.

Co-chairing the event were
Megan Davis, Olga Gamburg and
William Robinson.

Chrysler Sponsors Musical
Evening at Opera House

“We look forward
to seeing

fantastic photos”
– Jason Stoicevich
Head of Fiat Brand

North America
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Jeg Coughlin, Jr. drove the
JEGS.com Mopar Dodge Dart to
victory at the 45th annual Na-
tional Hot Rod Association
(NHRA) Summernationals in Eng-
lishtown, N.J., to earn his 58th
career Pro Stock national title af-
ter reaching the final round of
eliminations for a third consecu-
tive event.

The defending NHRA factory
hot rod world champion has
been on a tear, said Chrysler
spokesperson Pat Caporali,
jumping from ninth place in the
points standings to second with
his two wins and a runner-up fin-
ish. He combined with his team-
mate, Allen Johnson, to put the
new Dodge Dart in the winner’s
circle at each of the last three
events.

“These last three weekends
have been a helluva hat trick for
J&J Racing, winning all three
races,” said Coughlin, who
earned both his wins this season
against Greg Anderson in the fi-
nal round, this time with an
elapsed time run of 6.510 sec-
onds (213.94 mph). “I got Atlanta
and Englishtown and A.J. won in
Topeka, so we’re on a great run."

“Congratulations to Jeg
Coughlin Jr. on his drive to the
winner’s circle at the Summerna-
tionals to continue this fantastic
streak of wins for the Dodge Dart
and his second of the year,” said
Pietro Gorlier, CEO of Mopar. “A
third consecutive win for the
Dodge Dart definitely helps vali-
date all the hard work that the
Mopar teams have put in with
the new vehicle. We look forward
to seeing what more Jeg and
Allen can do with HEMI and new
Dodge Dart combination in such
a competitive Pro Stock field.”

The win wasn’t easy, Caporali
said. Only five of the 16 Pro
Stock qualifiers completed runs
under full power in the opening
round. Track conditions even
claimed Mopar teammate and
top qualifier Johnson as a victim
in his first round match-up
against Chris McGaha, after pre-
viously resetting the track
record two days in a row in qual-
ifying with the Magneti Marelli
Dodge Dart at Old Bridge Town-
ship Raceway Park. Fellow Hemi-
powered driver Vieri “V.”Gaines
also succumbed in the first
round against Shane Gray.
Coughlin also wasn’t able to
make a clean run but persevered
to beat his first-round opponent
Kenny Delco to the stripe.

“That was a scare,” Coughlin
said. “Kenny's a hometown hero
and I know they wanted to win.
The track just wasn't there and
neither of us managed to launch
correctly. It was some violent
shake and I had to let the car set-
tle before I was able to get back
on the gas and get down the
track. Those moments seem to
last forever.

“The guys worked on it, soft-
ened the launch sequence a
touch, and we came back and
ran a decent 6.586 against Shane
Gray. We worked on it some
more and really had a pass
against Dave Connolly in a great
side-by-side race (6.524 to 6.535
second e.t.) and that got us to
the final. We had the kind of con-
ditions that Pro Stock cars love
today with a great barometer
and not a cloud in the sky but
you had to work for it.”

Mopar teammates Coughlin
and Johnson are currently tied
for second (668) in the Pro Stock
points race and have combined
for five national titles for Mopar
this season to date, Caporali
said.

Mopar teams and drivers will
have a one-week break in NHRA
Mello Yello Drag Racing Series
action before heading to Bristol,
Tenn., for the 14th annual NHRA
Thunder Valley Nationals at Bris-
tol Dragway June 13-15.

Mopar Dodge Dart
Races to Third
Straight NHRA Win



*Picture may not represent actual sale vehicle. All applicable rebates including Conquest or Lease Loyalty have been deducted from Sale Price/Payment and are subject to change by the manufacturer without notice and are
plus title, tax and plate fees. Leases are 10,000 miles per year, except where noted and are plus title, tax and plate fees. Lease pull ahead is for select customers on select vehicles. $1000 Over Kelley Blue Book is valid on
2004 – 2011 vehicles. No branded titles. Certain restrictions may apply, see dealer for complete details on all incentives/offers. Sale ends 6/6/2014 @ 6:00PM.

2014MALIBU “LT”
• 2 Yr/24,000 Scheduled Maintenance INCLUDED!

• 2.5L DOHC VVT Engine! • Automatic Transmission!
• Rear Vision Camera • Power Driver’s Seat!

• Remote Vehicle Start! • MyLink AM/FM/XM Radio w/CD!
• Aluminum Wheels!

• 36 MPG on the Highway!
Stk. #E17922 MSRP $25,700

NO 1ST PAYMENT
OR SECURITY DEPOSIT
REQUIRED. TAX, TITLE

AND PLATE FEES EXTRA!

2014CRUZE “LT”
• 2 Yr/24,000 Scheduled Maintenance INCLUDED!

• ECOTEC 1.4L “Turbo” DOHC Engine! • Automatic Transmission!
• Power Driver’s Seat! • Remote Vehicle Start!

• MyLink AM/FM/XM Radio w/CD!
• Aluminum Wheels!

• 38 MPG on the Highway!
Stk. #E17730MSRP$21,365

NO 1ST PAYMENT
OR SECURITY DEPOSIT
REQUIRED. TAX, TITLE

AND PLATE FEES EXTRA!

2014EQUINOX “LS”
• 2 Yr/24,000 Scheduled Maintenance INCLUDED!

• 2.4L DOHC Engine! • Automatic Transmission!
• Power Locks & Windows! • Cruise & Tilt Wheel!

• AM/FM/XM Radio w/CD!
• Remote Keyless Entry!
• 17” Aluminum Wheels!

• 32 MPG on the Highway!
Stk. #E15737MSRP$25,315

NO SECURITY DEPOSIT
REQUIRED. TAX, TITLE

AND PLATE FEES EXTRA!

LEASE PULL AHEAD RETURNS FOR SELECT CUSTOMERS!

WE NEED YOUR TRADE-IN…$1,000 OVER KELLEY BLUE BOOK®

2014SILVERADO“LT”

$159
SALE

$159 SALE • $159 SALE • $159 SALE • $159 SALE • $159 SALE • $159 SALE

• 2 Yr/24,000 Scheduled Maintenance INCLUDED!
• ECOTEC 4.3L Engine! • Automatic Transmission!
• Power Locks & Windows! • Cruise & Tilt Wheel!

• 17” Aluminum Wheels!
• 4.2” Color Screen Radio!
• 23 MPG on the Highway!
Stk. #E18459MSRP $38,725

NO SECURITY DEPOSIT
REQUIRED. TAX, TITLE

AND PLATE FEES EXTRA!

4X4
DBL.
DOOR

Starting At

$17,856

36 Month Lease

$159
Just$0Down

Starting At

$21,189

36 Month Lease

$159
Just$1,999Down

Starting At

$21,308

24 Month Lease

$159
Just$1,399Down

Starting At

$30,072

24 Month Lease

$159
Just$1,499Down
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Jeff Caul
586-274-0396
PEP QUOTES BY PHONE OR EMAIL:
JEFF CAUL AT JCAUL@BUFFWHELAN.COM

Free shuttle service to home, office or shopping.

buff whelan chevrolet
WHERE THE DEALS MAKE THE DIFFERENCE, EVERY DAY SINCE 1970!

Van Dyke • South of 18 Mile • Sterling Heights

☺ We guarantee the lowest price or it’s free! ☺ We guarantee the lowest price or it’s free!

☺ We guarantee the lowest price or it’s free! ☺ We guarantee the lowest price or it’s free!
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*See dealer for details. All Rebates/Incentives have been deducted from sale price/payment and are subject to change by manufacturer
without notice. GM Employee discount required unless otherwise noted. All leases include GM Lease Loyalty or Conquest unless otherwise
noted. All lease payments are based on 10,000 miles per year. 1st payment, tax, title and plate fee due at signing on all leases. To qualify
for Cruze or Malibu lease loyalty the lease must expire prior to December 31st, 2014. It DOES NOT have to be terminated and is transferrable
within the household with proper documentation. All programs expire June 30th, 2014.

CONVENIENT HOURS:
Mon. & Thurs.

8:30 am – 9 pm
Tues., Wed., Fri.

8:30 am – 6:30 pm

��
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METRO PKWY.

18 MILE RD.

SINCE
1989

2.4L DOHC 4 Cylinder with VVT
FWD, 6 Speed Automatic

36 Month Lease/10,000 Miles

Stk.#43157

2014 EQUINOXLS

$185*
+Tax with $0 Down

w/Cruze Lease Loyalty

No Security Deposit Required

Stk.#42311

2014 IMPALA LS
NO SECURITY
DEPOSIT
REQUIRED

NO SECURITY
DEPOSIT
REQUIRED

Ecotec 2.5L DOHC
6 Speed Automatic & More…

36 Month Lease/10,000 Miles

No Security Deposit Required

OVER 1,000
New Chevrolets in Stock!

WE GUARANTEE THEWE GUARANTEE THE
LOWEST PRICES OR IT’S FREELOWEST PRICES OR IT’S FREE☺☺

586-274-0396
Stk.#43029

2014 CRUZE 1LT

1.4L Ecotec Turbo
6 Speed Automatic & More…

36 Month Lease/10,000 Miles

$151*+Tax with$0 Down
No Security Deposit Required

NO SECURITY
DEPOSIT
REQUIRED

$200*
+Tax with $0 Down

w/Malibu Lease Loyalty

$214*
+Tax with $0 Down
w/GM Lease Loyalty

or Conquest

$197*
+Tax with $0 Down

w/Cruze Lease Loyalty

$225*
+Tax with $0 Down

w/Malibu Lease Loyalty

$253*
+Tax with $0 Down
w/GM Lease Loyalty

or Conquest

The deals are
alwaysHOT

at

buff whelan
chevrolet

From left, Josh Kuligowski, Kyle Scheel and Joe Coppens at library

by Jim Stickford

Some things are worth remem-
bering and honoring, and that’s
just what the Warren Public Li-
brary did for the 70th anniver-
sary of the June 6, 1944, D-Day In-
vasion of France.

Three members of the Michi-
gan Military Historical & Techni-
cal Society in Eastpointe were at
the central branch of the library
on June 5 to talk about D-Day.

The trio are war reenactors
and were dressed as soldiers
who would have participated in
the airborne portion of the at-
tack, as well as the first wave and
third wave attacks on Normandy
Beach.

Joe Coppens, dressed as a
member of the 501st Parachute
Regiment in the 82nd Airborne
Division, noted that the lecture
began at 6 p.m. Eastern Standard
Time, which would be midnight
in France.

“The assault on Normandy be-
gan at midnight local time,” Cop-
pens said. “We are doing this 70
years to the hour after the first
part of the D-Day invasion took
place. That really makes you
think.”

Coppens said that as a para-
trooper, he would have had to
carry all the supplies he would
need for three days. He then
showed the audience just how
much gear a paratrooper would
carry. It filled a table.

Josh Kuligowski was portray-
ing a soldier that would have
come in the first wave.

His pile of gear wasn’t as large
at Coppens’, but because he was
a first-wave soldier, it was still
more than what a soldier who
came later in the invasion would
carry.

Kyle Scheel portrayed a sol-

dier who hit the beach later in
the invasion.

Those who came later
wouldn’t have had to carry as
much gear because it was as-
sumed that the beachhead
would have been established,
therefore rear echelon troops
could follow with more supplies.

The three talked about why
they carried the gear and what
the role of each soldier would
have been.

Part of being a reenactor is
having gear that is authentic to
the time and place. They carried
everything from replicas of
weapons to a duplicate of the ac-
tual Army-issued can opener
troops needed to open their food
rations.

All three had relatives who
fought in the war and this was
their way to honor them.

Audience questions dealt with
the actual D-Day battle, including
what happened to Allied troops
who were taken prisoner.

Scheel said that, on the west-
ern front, both sides pretty much
respected the Geneva Conven-
tion, adding that wasn’t the case
on the Russian Front or in the
war against Japan.

Ultimately, Scheel said, what
happened at D-Day was an event
that shaped the history of the
20th century and is something
worth remembering.

Kuligowski said the three were
pleased to have the chance to
show the public just what Ameri-
can soldiers did to free Europe
from Nazi tyranny, pointing out
that the men who landed at Nor-
mandy and those who followed
changed the world into what we
have today. “We’re glad the War-
ren Library is doing something to
educate the public about that
historic event,” he said.

A Look at How Beaches at
Normandy Changed World

DETROIT (AP) – Ford is recall-
ing 1.4 million SUVs and cars in
North America to fix steering,
rust and floor mat problems.

The recalls come as automo-
bile safety is being watched
closely by Congress, the Justice
Department and the National
Highway Traffic Safety Adminis-
tration.

All are investigating General
Motors’ delayed recall of small
cars for ignition switch prob-
lems. Also, Justice recently made
Toyota pay a $1.2 billion penalty
for hiding information from gov-
ernment safety regulators.

In the largest of the Ford re-
calls last week, the company is
calling back 915,000 Ford Escape
and Mercury Mariner small SUVs
to fix a problem with a torque
sensor within the steering col-
umn. The problem could cause

loss of power-assisted steering,
making the SUVs more difficult to
control and increasing the risk of
a crash, Ford says.

The company recommends
one of three fixes: replacing the
sensor, updating software or re-
placing the steering column. The
recall affects 2008 through 2011
vehicles built between Aug. 18,
2006, and Sept. 11, 2010.

Another recall covers 196,000
Ford Explorer SUVs from the
2011 through 2013 model years.
An electrical problem in a steer-
ing gear can knock out power
steering. Dealers will either up-
date software or replace the
steering gear.

Ford also issued two addition-
al recalls May 29 affecting Ford
Taurus and Fusion, Mercury Mi-
lan, and Lincoln Zephyr and MKZ
models.

Ford Recalls Its Escapes and
Mariners for Steering Issue
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#42333 #21552#44296

475 SUMMIT DRIVE • 248-292-2502 • 5825 HIGHLAND RD. (M59) • WATERFORD

CALL
BRUCE LITVIN
– 24/7 & 365 –

40 YEARS
OF QUALITY SERVICE

CELL # 1-586-405-5175
blitvin@lunghamer.com

1-888-665-5438

All leases are 36 months and 10K miles per year.
All payment are plus tax,title, doc and plate fees. All payments are GMS pricing.

For the Cruze, must have Ally, or US bank lease in household.

‘14 CHEVROLETCRUZE
MSRP $20,735

GM Employee Price
$19,324

Lease for 36 months

0 DOWN NO SECURITY DEPOSIT REQUIRED

$152*
mo

MMAAYY
WWAASS GGRREEAATT

JJUUNNEE
WWIILLLL BBEE BBEETTTTEERR AASS TTHHEE
GGRREEAATT LLEEAASSEE DDEEAALLSS
CCOONNTTIINNUUEE……

PPLLEEAASSEE CCAALLLL
FFOORR SSOOMMEE OOFF TTHHEE LLOOWWEESSTT LLEEAASSEE PPRRIICCEESS NNOOWW..

GM EMPLOYEE
PRE-OWNED HEADQUARTERS

SUBURBAN
Suburban Buick GMC

of Ferndale
877-913-5085

21800 Woodward Ave.
Ferndale, MI 48220

Tech
CenterZoo

I-696

W
O
O
D
W
A
R
D

�
Suburban Buick GMC

of Ferndale

www.SuburbanBuickGMCofFerndale.com

877-913-5085
If you don’t see it, I’ll get it! Ask for Bob Cornwell Jr. – Sales Manager

��

2004 CHEVY COLORADO • 86,000Miles NOW $11,995LSCrewCab •NewTires &Brakes • VeryClean!

2009 CHEVYMALIBU NOW $11,995LT • Leather Seats • Black onBlack •Nice!

2009 CHEVY TRAVERESE $12,995LT • Leather Seats • Third Row •CD

2011 BUICK REGAL $14,995GMCertified • Ready ToGo!

2012 CHEVY COLORADO •Work Truck – Ext. Cab $14,995WorkCap Includes Tool Boxes & Ladder!

2008 GMC ACADIA NOW $14,995SLT-2 •Heated Leather Seats • Third Row •Sunroof!

2012 CHEVY CRUZE $15,555RS •Auto Transmission •GMCertified • Sharp!

2009 BUICK ENCLAVE $18,777CXL •Sunroof • Leather Seats • Third Row!

2012 GMC SIERRA $23,998SLE • 4Door Ext. Cab •GMCertified • Bedliner

2010 YUKON DENALI $35,777Motor City Edition • 22”ChromeWheels, DVD, Navigation

A Japanese automotive parts
manufacturer will pay $19.9 mil-
lion in criminal fines, according
to a recent FBI statement.

Showa Corp., based in Saitama,
Japan, has agreed to plead guilty
and to pay the fine for its role in
a conspiracy to fix prices and rig
bids.

The parts targeted were for
pinion-assist-type electric pow-
ered steering assemblies in-
stalled in cars sold in the United
States and elsewhere.

The U.S. Department of Justice
says the one-count felony charge
was filed in the U.S. District
Court for the Southern District of
Ohio in Cincinnati, alleging
Showa’s conspiracy to suppress
and eliminate competition in the
automotive parts industry.

The charge states that Showa
officials agreed to rig bids for
and to fix, stabilize, and maintain
the prices of the steering assem-
blies.

The assemblies were sold to
Honda Motor Co. Ltd. and cer-
tain of its subsidiaries in the
United States and elsewhere.

In addition to the criminal fine,
the Justice Department stated,
Showa has agreed to cooperate
with the department’s ongoing
investigation. The plea agree-
ment is subject to court ap-
proval.

“This guilty plea marks the
27th time a company has been
held accountable for fixing prices
on parts used to manufacture
cars in the United States,” said
Bill Baer, assistant attorney gen-
eral in charge of the Department
of Justice’s Antitrust Division.

“The Antitrust Division and its
law enforcement partners remain
committed to prosecuting illegal
cartels that harm U.S. consumers
and businesses.”

According to the charge,
Showa and its co-conspirators
carried out the conspiracy
through meetings, conversa-
tions, and communications.

In its press release, the Justice
Department stated that Showa
then submitted quotations in ac-
cordance with those agreements
and sold pinion-assist type elec-
tric powered steering assemblies
at collusive and noncompetitive
prices.

Showa and its co-conspirators
monitored adherence to the
agreed-upon bid-rigging and
price-fixing scheme.

Showa’s involvement in the
conspiracy lasted from at least
as early as 2007 until as late as
September 2012.

Including Showa, 27 compa-
nies and 24 executives have
pleaded guilty or agreed to plead
guilty in the division’s ongoing
investigation into price-fixing
and bid-rigging in the auto parts
industry and have agreed to pay
a total of $2.3 billion in criminal
fines, the Justice Department
stated.

The press release stated that
this charge is the result of an on-
going federal antitrust investiga-
tion into price-fixing, bid-rigging,
and other anti-competitive con-
duct in the automotive parts in-
dustry, which is being conducted
by the Antitrust Division’s crimi-
nal enforcement sections and the
FBI.

In a separate filing in Detroit
on May 21, two DENSO Corpora-
tion executives – Yuji Suzuki and
Hiroshi Watanabe – have agreed
to plead guilty for their roles in
international conspiracies to fix
prices and rig bids of certain au-
tomotive components installed
in U.S. cars.

The executives, both Japanese

nationals, have also agreed to
serve time in a U.S. prison.

Suzuki, a senior manager in
DENSO’s Toyota Sales Division,
has agreed to serve 16 months in
a U.S. prison, to pay a $20,000
criminal fine, and to cooperate
with the department’s ongoing
investigation.

Watanabe, a group leader in
DENSO’s Toyota Sales Division at
the time of the offense, has
agreed to serve 15 months in a
U.S. prison, to pay a $20,000
criminal fine, and to cooperate
with the department’s ongoing
investigation.

“The conspirators reached
agreements to fix prices and allo-
cate bids and took measures
such as using code names and
meeting in secret to cover their
tracks,” said Scott D. Hammond,
deputy assistant attorney gener-
al for the Antitrust Division’s
criminal enforcement program.

According to the two-count
felony charge filed in U.S. District
Court for the Eastern District of
Michigan in Detroit, Suzuki, along
with co-conspirators, engaged in
a conspiracy to rig bids for and
to fix, stabilize, and maintain the
prices of electronic control units
and heater control panels sold to
Toyota Motor Corporation and
Toyota Motor Engineering and
Manufacturing North America
Inc. in the United States and else-
where.

“Those individuals who engage
in price-fixing and bid-rigging
negatively impact the automo-
tive industry by causing vehicle
buyers and makers to pay higher
prices,” said Robert D. Foley III,
special agent in charge, FBI De-
troit Division.

“The FBI is committed to pur-
suing and prosecuting these
criminals.”

Feds Nab Japanese Manufacturers and Their
Execs in Price-Fixing, Bid-Rigging Scandal

Wally Edgar
Chevrolet Employee HQ

Be treated with the respect you deserve.
TOP DOLLAR FOR YOUR TRADE & the Best Deal PERIOD!!

Wally Edgar
Chevrolet

Located right o!
I-75 onM-24,

2minutes N. of the
Palace of Auburn Hills

1-866-906-0279

JAY CHAISER x117
Fax: 248-391-0189
Cell: 248-821-8026
Email:
jchaiser@wallyedgar.com

SalesHours:
Mon. - Thur. 8:00am-8:00pm
Fri. 8:00am-6:00pm
Sat. 9:30am-3:00pm
Sun. Closed

CHEVY DEALER CODE 44085

www.wallyedgar.com • www.wallyedgar.com • www.wallyedgar.com • www.wallyedgar.com
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Make us your Michigan P.E.P. Car Connection

*Lease payment examples based on GM Employee Discount price plus tax. Title, plate, first month payment (except Cruze) and all docu-
ment fees due at signing with all rebates including USAAmilitary rebate assigned to dealer. No security deposit necessary with approved credit.
Leasee responsible for excess wear and tear as well as exceeding contracted mileage. Due to advertising deadlines price subject to change.

2014 CAMARO

$197*

36MONTH • 10K LEASE
$999 DOWN

2014 EQUINOX

$168*

36MONTH • 10K LEASE
$999 DOWN

2014 CRUZE
$98*

36MONTH • 10K LEASE
$999 DOWN

FIRST PAYMENTWAIVED !



GENEVA (AP) – The United
States has scored a victory be-
fore the World Trade Organiza-
tion in a case that challenged
China’s imposition of penalty tar-
iffs on the sale of $5 billion in
U.S.-made vehicles in China.

A WTO panel has ruled that
China’s tariffs violated interna-
tional trade rules.

The ruling came during a week
when the U.S. Justice Depart-
ment charged five Chinese mili-
tary officers with hacking into
U.S. companies’ computer sys-
tems to steal trade secrets.

The two developments pointed
to intensifying trade tensions be-
tween the world’s two biggest
economies.

The dispute panel for the
Geneva-based WTO sided with
the United States in its ruling. It
said China had acted “inconsis-
tently’’ in imposing the anti-
dumping requirements in viola-
tion of its WTO commitments.

U.S. officials said China with-
drew the higher tariffs in Decem-
ber in response to indications
that it would lose the WTO case.
Officials said they pushed for-
ward with the case to establish
the precedent that China’s ac-
tions violated global trade rules.

The WTO allows countries to
raise import duties to offset im-
proper subsidies and dumping.
But the complaint the Obama ad-
ministration filed in 2012 ac-
cused Beijing of improperly im-
posing the anti-dumping duties.

The administration contended
that China’s tariffs were imposed
in retaliation for penalty tariffs
the administration had levied on
Chinese-made tires.

China had defended the duties
on U.S.-made vehicles as legal un-
der international rules. It assert-
ed that the administration’s
bailouts of General Motors Corp.
and Chrysler amounted to unfair
government subsidies. China’s
duties affected cars and sport-
utility vehicles with engine ca-
pacities of 2.5 liters or larger.

U.S. Trade Representative
Michael Froman said the WTO rul-
ing would benefit America’s near-
ly 850,000 auto workers. China
has become America’s second-
largest auto export market. In
2013, the United States exported
$64.9 billion of autos, with $8.5 bil-
lion of that total going to China.

Froman said the penalty du-
ties, ranging up to 21.5 percent,
hit $5.1 billion of America’s auto
exports to China last year. The
penalties covered such popular
models as the Jeep Grand Chero-
kee, the Cadillac Escalade and
the Buick Enclave.

“This is the third time that the
United States has prevailed in a
WTO dispute challenging China’s
unjustified trade remedies,’’ Fro-
man told reporters in Washington.

The two other disputes in-
volved U.S. specialty steel prod-
ucts and chicken broiler parts.

The Obama administration has
been more aggressive in filing WTO

cases against China than the Bush
administration was and has stepped
up pressure in other areas of trade.
The U.S. trade gap with China,
which is at a record high, is its
largest with any country.

Besides this week’s indictment
of five Chinese officials on hack-
ing charges, Treasury Secretary
Jacob Lew flew to Beijing last
month for talks that covered U.S.
concerns that China’s currency
has been falling in value this
year. American manufacturers
contend that China’s renminbi is
as much as 40 percent underval-
ued against the dollar, giving Chi-
nese companies an unfair trade
advantage.

Rep. Sander Levin, D-Michigan,
said the May 23 ruling was a “sig-
nificant victory in the fight
against China’s practice of retali-
ating and intimidating those who
dare to stand up to it.’’

Still pending before the WTO is
a second auto case the United
States filed in 2012. It challenges
export subsidies that China pro-
vides for its own car and auto
parts manufacturers.
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Ford honored its top-perform-
ing suppliers from around the
globe at its World Excellence
Awards last week.

Now in its 16th year, the World
Excellence Awards were de-
signed to recognize suppliers
who exceed company expecta-
tions and distinguish themselves
from their peers by achieving the
highest levels of global excel-
lence in quality, cost and deliv-
ery performance.

“These suppliers have demon-
strated the highest level of excel-
lence, and we are honored to
have them as part of the One
Ford team,” said Hau Thai-Tang,
group vice president, Global Pur-
chasing.

“Ford Motor Company is ex-
tremely proud to recognize the
excellent performance of our
suppliers and their contribution
to our success.

“Your companies’ commitment
to quality, cutting-edge technolo-
gy and cost efficiency is a vital
part of the One Ford plan. Thank
you for helping Ford achieve our
business objectives and deliver
world-class products and out-
standing value to our cus-
tomers.”

Fifty-one awards were present-
ed this year.

Gold and Silver awards were
presented to supplier manufac-
turing sites that demonstrated
superior quality, delivery and
cost performance throughout
2013.

Recognition of Achievement
awards were given to suppliers
who improved customer satisfac-
tion by providing significant con-
tributions in such key areas as
new consumer-focused technolo-
gy, durability and reliability per-
formance, corporate responsibil-
ity, supplier diversity develop-
ment and community service.

“Congratulations to all of our
supplier partners who have
demonstrated a commitment to
excellence as we together work
to achieve mutual growth,” said
Ford Chief Operating Officer
Mark Fields.

“Our suppliers are key to the

success of our One Ford plan, in-
cluding our commitment to ac-
celerate our pace of progress
and deliver even more of the
great products and innovations
that will create even more
growth and define our company
going forward.”

Recently, Ford was recognized
by the supplier community for
its continued emphasis on being
suppliers’ OEM of Choice. As
part of the Society for Automo-
tive Analysts 2014 Planning Per-
spectives survey, suppliers ac-
knowledged Ford as the top do-
mestic automaker in supplier re-
lations, putting the company in a
tie for second place as most pre-
ferred OEM to work with.

The World Excellence Awards
recognize suppliers who not only
achieve the highest level of cost
competitiveness, quality and de-
livery, but also acknowledge the
diverse cultures, values and
ideas of the thousands of individ-
uals they employ.

First distributed in 1998, the
World Excellence Awards honor
both production and nonproduc-
tion suppliers. Last week’s cere-
mony was held at Ford Motor
Company World Headquarters in
Dearborn.

Ford Suppliers Demonstrate
‘Highest Level of Excellence’

WTO Ruling to ‘Benefit U.S. Auto Workers’
– Trade Representative Michael Froman

ANN ARBOR, Mich. (AP) – A
group of universities represent-
ing Michigan, Ohio and Indiana
is getting nearly $2.5 million to
help small- and medium-size
companies affected by military
spending cuts.

The U-M’s Institute for Re-
search on Labor, Employment,
and the Economy has been
awarded the grant in partner-
ship with Ohio State University
and Purdue University. It’s for a
regional Defense Manufacturing
Assistance Program.

The federal funds are from the
Office of Economic Adjustment.
The money will assist companies
in Michigan, Indiana and Ohio in
finding new markets.

Federal Funds Aid
Military Firms

These “Hot Rods Forever” stamps are available at local post offices.

Hot Rods have been an Ameri-
can icon since the 1920s when
automotive buffs started soup-
ing-up engines and transforming
their cars to match their person-
alities.

“The world of customized cars
is still alive today in American
pop culture and can be found
everywhere from movies and
television to car shows and
museums,” said U.S. Post
Office spokesperson Kayla
Meyers.

To honor automotive buffs and
to celebrate the fast, powerful
vehicles that have brought to-
gether generations of hot rod

fans for nearly a century, the U.S.
Postal Service on June 6 unveiled
a new stamp.

The new limited-edition Hot
Rods Forever stamps debuted at
the NSRA Street Rod Nationals
East Plus in York, Pa., at a first-
day-of-issue ceremony.

Patrick Donahoe, postmaster
general and CEO of the U.S.
Postal Service, and Barry
Meguiar, lifelong car enthusiast
and host of the TV show, “Car
Crazy,” helped unveil the new
stamps.

Each of the two stamps show-
cases an iconic 1932 Ford
“Deuce” roadster.

U.S. Stamps Honor Hot Rods



The Chevrolet Traverse is one
of the 10 Best Family Cars of
2014, according to Edmunds.com
and Parents magazine.

It’s the second consecutive
year Traverse made the list in
the SUV category.

Criteria, for consideration in-
cluded strong safety, said GM
spokesperson Otie McKinley.
Traverse earned a Top Safety
Pick recommendation in 2013
from the Insurance Institute for
Highway Safety and has a 5-star
rating in government crash tests.

In a descripion of the Traverse
on the Edmunds web page, edi-
tors wrote, “If you’d rather not
purchase a minivan, but need a
vehicle with similar passenger
capacity, the Traverse is an ex-
cellent choice.

“It seats up to eight passen-
gers and offers impressive cargo
capacity. With the third row fold-
ed flat, there’s 70.3 cubic feet
available for cargo, and that fig-
ure jumps to 116.3 cubic feet
with the second row stowed. An
all-wheel-drive transmission is
available for drivers who often
tangle with rain and snow.

“Fuel economy is respectable,
with the front-wheel-drive Tra-
verse getting 19 mpg combined
(17 city/24 highway). Bluetooth
and a rearview camera are stan-
dard, and options include a
blind-spot warning system with
rear cross-traffic monitoring, a
forward-collision alert system,
and a lane-departure warning
system.”

Steve Majoros, marketing di-
rector of Chevrolet cars and
crossovers, said, “Traverse’s
winning combination blends the
capability and roominess of a
traditional SUV with the attrib-
utes of a crossover, including a
car-like driving experience, low
step-in height and good efficien-
cy on the highway.”

The recognition adds to Tra-
verse’s accolades for the year. It
also was named one of Kelley
Blue Book’s 12 Best Family Cars
for 2014, McKinley said.

And all this recognition ap-
pears to be paying off, he said.

“Demand for Traverse is up,
too, with sales jumping 24 per-
cent in May from year-ago num-
bers for the month,” McKinley
said.

“The vehicle provides features
that consumers say they want in
an SUV. For example, the Tra-
verse leads with the segment’s
only front seat center air bag. It
deploys from the inboard side of
the driver’s seat and inflates be-
tween the driver and front pas-
senger, providing added protec-
tion for both front occupants.”

Traverse also offers advanced
crash-avoidance technologies,
he said, including forward colli-
sion alert and lane departure
warning that use a camera and
sensors to alert the driver with
visual cues on the dashboard, as
well as audible signals.

It’s also fuel-efficient, said
McKinley, adding that the Tra-

verse’s standard 3.6L V6 uses di-
rect injection technology to de-
liver up to 288 horsepower and
EPA-rated highway fuel economy
of 24 mpg.

“That’s comparable with com-
petitors’ SUVs and crossovers,
many of which cannot match
Traverse’s roominess or capabili-
ty,” McKinley said. “When prop-
erly equipped, it can tow up to
5,200 pounds. All-wheel drive
also is available.”

And GM, McKinley said, is not
afraid to put its money where its
mouth is. Chevrolet supports Tra-
verse owners with two
years/24,000 miles, whichever
comes first, of scheduled mainte-
nance, which covers four oil
changes, tire rotation and a 27-
point inspection.
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ED RINKE We Are Professional Grade

GM EMPLOYEE PRICE TO EVERYONE SALE

LEASE PULL AHEAD FOR SELECT CUSTOMERS

NEWSILVERADO

PURCHASE
FOR

$32,499*
LEASE
FOR

$282*
$999DOWN

2014

NEWSILVERADO

PURCHASE
FOR

$28,215*
LEASE
FOR

$148*
$999DOWN

2014

NEWCRUZE

PURCHASE
FOR

$16,775*
LEASE
FOR

$99*
$999DOWN

2014

NEWMALIBU

PURCHASE
FOR

$19,998*
LEASE
FOR

$158*
$999DOWN

2014

"WE NEED YOUR TRADE-IN...$1,000 OVER KELLY BLUE BOOK

SERVICE HOURS: Monday & Thursday 6:30am-9:00pm; Tuesday, Wednesday & Friday 6:30am-6:00pm • Shuttle at 6:30am - Pick-up Both Ways • All Day starting at 6:30am.

$2395
Fluid Level,

Brake & Alignment Check Included.

Open Mondays & Thursdays until 8:30pm

We use Genuine GM Oil & Filter
No additional or hidden charges.
Out the door pricing.

Quick Oil Change EXPRESS
LANELUBE OIL FILTER

Excludes synthetic, Diesel & Med. Duty Trucks.
Most GM cars & trucks. One coupon per customer. Must
present coupon with order. Plus tax. Expires 6-30-14.

Up to 5 qts.

BODY SHOP
586-754-7000

ext 1231

INSURANCE
WRECK

AMENDED

WE REPAIR
ALL MAKES
& MODELS FREE OIL CHANGE

With Each Major Repair

TRANSPORTATION AVAILABLE
During Scheduled Repairs

GM SERVICE CENTER
MICHIGAN’S LARGEST

•SERVICE DEPT. •PARTS •BODY SHOP

866-452-1547
26125 Van Dyke @ 101/2 Mile

Center Line, MI 48015

EDRINKE • FAST • FRIENDLY • DISCOUNTS

VISIT OUR

QUICK LANE

NEWVERANO

PURCHASE
FOR

$19,585*
LEASE
FOR

$138*
$1,999DOWN

2014

NEWSIERRA

PURCHASE FOR
$30,689*

LEASE
FOR

$143*
$1,999DOWN

2014

NEWLACROSSE

PURCHASE
FOR

$27,530*
LEASE
FOR

$141*
$1,999DOWN

2014

NEWREGAL

PURCHASE
FOR

$26,335*
LEASE
FOR

$172*
$1,999DOWN

2014

NEWTERRAIN

PURCHASE
FOR

$23,110*
LEASE
FOR

$108*
$1,999DOWN

2014

NEWENCLAVE

PURCHASE
FOR

$33,325*
LEASE
FOR

$224*
$1,999DOWN

2014

YUKON

PURCHASE
FOR

$43,380*
LEASE
FOR

$202*
$1,999DOWN

2015

NEWACADIA

PURCHASE
FOR

$30,305*
LEASE
FOR

$190*
$1,999DOWN

2014

See us for your GM employee purchases.

1-877-451-7707
26125 Van Dyke at 101/2 Mile Rd.

Visit our website: edrinke.com
SHOWROOM HOURS: Mon. & Thurs. 8:30am-9:00pm; Tues., Wed., & Fri. 8:30am-6:00pm

All prices&payments includeGMrebates. Picturesmaynot represent actual vehicle. Prices subject to changeperGM incentives. Prices andpayments are inclusive of
activeGMEmployeeDiscount (Unless otherwise stated). Leases are 36months,10,000miles per yearw/ approvedSTier creditw/ $999due at signing, (unless other-
wise noted). Cruze lease is a 39month term. Silverado Double Cab,Equinox, Impala, and Camaro leases are 24month. Prices & payments are plus tax, title, and plate
feeswithacquisition feeupfront.Refundablesecuritydeposit requiredoncertainvehicles– tobedeterminedby lender.Mustqualify forConquestor leaseLoyalty.$1000
over Kelley BlueBook is valid on 2004-2011 vehicleswith under 115kmiles,no branded titles,see sales person for details. **Certain restrictionsmay apply,see dealer
for complete details. Expiration Date – 6/30/2014

Nicole
Dodge

nhuminski@edrinke.com

Jim
Pfeifle

jpfeifle@edrinke.com

Find Us on
FACEBOOK

NO DOC
FEES

Dennis
Thacker

dthacker@edrinke.com

Paul
Makowski

pmakowski@edrinke.com

See us for your GM employee purchases.

1-866-452-1300
24231 Van Dyke at 91/2 Mile Rd.

Visit our website: edrinke.com
SHOWROOM HOURS: Mon. & Thurs. 8:30am-9:00pm; Tues., Wed., & Fri. 8:30am-6:00pm

All prices&payments includeGMrebates. Picturesmaynot represent actual vehicle. Prices subject to changeperGM incentives. Prices andpayments are inclusive of
activeGMEmployeeDiscount (Unless otherwise stated). Leases are 36months,10,000miles per yearw/ approvedSTier creditw/ $999due at signing, (unless other-
wise noted). Lacrosse,Terrain,Yukon,and Sierra leases are 24month terms. Prices & payments are plus tax, title, and plate feeswith acquisition fee up front. Refund-
able security deposit required on certain vehicles – to be determined by lender. Must qualify for Conquest or lease Loyalty. $1000 over Kelley Blue Book is valid on
2004-2011 vehicleswith under 115kmiles, no branded titles, see sales person for details. **Certain restrictionsmay apply, see dealer for complete details. Expiration
Date – 6/30/2014

NEWTRAVERSE

PURCHASE
FOR

$26,305*
LEASE
FOR

$175*
$999DOWN

2014

NEWEQUINOX

PURCHASE
FOR

$19,780*
LEASE
FOR

$105*
$999DOWN

2014

NEWCAMARO

PURCHASE
FOR

$19,815*
LEASE
FOR

$120*
$999DOWN

2014

NEW IMPALA

PURCHASE
FOR

$22,245*
LEASE
FOR

$114*
$999DOWN

2014

DBL. CAB
4X4

DBL. CAB
4X4

CREW
CAB
4X4

Now looking for experienced salespeople to join our team!

STERLING
TIRE & AUTO

586-264-7775
www.SterlingTireAndAuto.com

34701 VAN DYKE
SOUTH OF 15 MILE RD

Next To Budget/Avis • Sterling Heights
Hours: Mon-Fri 8am-6pm • Sat 9am-2pm • FREE Shuttle Service

WE SELL TIRES
QUALITY SERVICE YOU CAN TRUST!

NATIONAL FLEET ACCOUNTS WELCOME

BIG 3 EMPLOYEES
EXTRA 10% OFF ENTIRE BILL

Excludes Tires • FREE Car Wash with Any Service

GM CERTIFIED & TRAINED
OVER 75 YEARS OF EXPERIENCE

We Accept All Extended Warranties Including GM, Chrysler, Ford, Etc.

MAINTENANCE SPECIAL
Includes: • Full Service Oil Change & Filter

• Lube & Top Off All Fluids
• Semi Synthetic Blend (5W30) up to 5 qts.

$2595
FREE Tire Rotation • FREE 27 Pt. Inspection

FREE Brake Inspection (Drums Extra)

$4595 Full Service
Synthetic Oil Change

Shop Charges And Disposal Extra.
Most Cars. Not Valid With Any Other Discount. Offer Expires 6-23-14.

OR

A/C RECHARGE
$6995

Includes: • Up To 1lb Freon • Check For Leaks
• Pressure Test System • Add Dye

Most Cars. Not Valid With Any Other Discount.
Offer Expires 6-23-14.

SAVE
$30

Reg. $99.95

FREE
BRAKE

INSPECTION
Most Cars. drums Extra.

Brake Pad Special Starting At $89
Most Cars. Not Valid With Any Other Discount.

Offer Expires 6-23-14.

FREE
ALIGNMENT
WITH PURCHASE

OF 4 TIRES
Most Cars. Not Valid With Any Other Discount. Offer Expires 6-23-14.

COMPLETE
VEHICLE
DETAILING

Reg. $129.95.

Include Exterior Wash,
Vacuum & Shampoo

and Hand Wax
Most Cars. Not Valid With Any Other Discount. Offer Expires 6-23-14.

$99
Over

30 Years
Experience

Starting At

FRONT END
ALIGNMENT
$2995

Most Cars. Not Valid With Any Other Discount. Offer Expires 6-23-14.

Traverse Hits Top 10 List of
Family Cars by Two Media

Club GM and the UAW are
sponsoring a raffle to help the
March of Dimes. The grand prize
is a 2014 Corvette Stingray.

Raffle tickets – one for $40,
two for $60 – may be purchased
at Club GM stores in the VEC
Building on June 10, the Design
Center Building on June 12 and
13 and the GM Powertrain Global
Headquarters in Pontiac on June
18.

The winning ticket will be
drawn on Thursday, June 19, at
the UAW GM Center for Human
Resources in Detroit. For more
info, contact Katie Murphy at
katherine.murphy@gm.com or
call her at 586-441-8670.

Club GM, UAW Aid
March of Dimes
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Call Toll Free:

New
Saturday Hours:
Sales 10am-3pm &
Service 8am-2pm

HOURS: Mon/Thurs 8:30am-8pm
Tue/Wed/Fri 8:30am-6pm

800-710-3857
OPEN SATURDAY!

3800 S. Lapeer Rd., LAKE ORION

YOUR OFFICIAL CHRYSLER JEEP • DODGE LEASE TURN-IN HEADQUARTERS

SCAN
ME

CHECK YOUR
TRADE IN
VALUE HERE

•Wemake car buying fun at Milosch’s Palace. Please call to schedule an appointment for a demonstration drive.All rebates to dealer.
Deals apply to stock units only. Must be a Chrysler employee. $1995 down, plus destination, taxes, title, plates. Must be Chrysler
Employee. $500 Military and TDM included. Lease calculated at 10,000 miles per year. Vehicle shown not actual vehicle. WAC. See
dealer for details. **Plus destination, taxes, title, plates, $0 sec. deposit required. Includes Conquest Trade-in and must be Chrysler
Employee. Programs subject to change. ††On select models. Expiration date is 6/30/14.

YOUR OFFICIAL CHRYSLER • JEEP • DODGE LEASE TURN-IN HEADQUARTERS

2014 RAM CREW CAB
4X4 BIG HORN

2014 CHRYSLER
TOWN & COUNTRY
TOURING
EDITION

$1,000

EMPLOYEE 1 PAY 24 MONTH
LEASE STARTING FROM
$4998*

24 MO. LEASE ONLY
$168*mo.

2014 CHRYSLER
300S AWD

EMPLOYEE 1 PAY 24 MONTH
LEASE STARTING FROM
$3789*

24 MO. LEASE
$158*mo.

SALE PRICE
$25,498*

EMPLOYEE 1 PAY 24 MONTH
LEASE STARTING FROM
$2989*

24 MO. LEASE
$129*mo.

2014 JEEP
GRAND CHEROKEE
LAREDO
4X4

SALE PRICE
$27,760*

24 MO. LEASE ONLY
$198*mo.

ALL NEW 2014 JEEP
CHEROKEE LATITUDE
4X4

EMPLOYEE 1 PAY 24 MONTH
LEASE STARTING FROM
$3989*

24 MO. LEASE
$169*mo.

2014 DODGE
JOURNEY SXT

EMPLOYEE 1 PAY 24 MONTH
LEASE STARTING FROM
$4989*

24 MO. LEASE ONLY
$119*mo.

2014 DODGE
CHARGER R/T

EMPLOYEE 1 PAY 24 MONTH
LEASE STARTING FROM
$3589*

24 MO. LEASE
$158*mo.

OVER 7700
AVAILABLE

MATCH 
FOR EVERYONE 

SALE
YOUR $1000 DOWN PAYMENT

IS NOW WORTH $2000!††
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